

Sheet1

BID TABULATION

Item Description: Repair Asphalt from Flood Damage

Date: 08/21/2017

Budget Amount:

Pace Construction						
Linda St.	No Bid – Already Done		Garfield Parking Lot	\$28,900.00		
Terra St.	No Bid – Already Done		6 th St. Bridge	\$8,100.00		
West Olden St.	\$17,800.00		5 th St. Bridge	\$8,700.00		
10 th St.	\$11,600.00		W. Broadway Bridge	\$4,500.00		
October Lane	\$74,000.00		Lincoln Ave Bridge	\$5,800.00		
Meadow Brook Dr.	\$3,800.00		Washington Ave Bridge	\$7,400.00		
Allen & E. Olden	\$3,500.00		Skate Park	\$41,100.00		
E. 1 st St.	\$10,800.00		Evans Trail	\$38,200.00		
Jackson St.	\$10,500.00		Don Warden Park	\$39,600.00		
N Thayer Ave	\$10,500.00		Muni Golf Course	\$6,800.00		
Waste Water Treatment	\$23,200.00		St. Louis Bridge	\$13,800.00		
Jackie Dr. Bridge	\$15,100.00		TOTAL	\$383,700.00		

Schedule of Prices

Bid prices shall be written in legibly. Bidder further assures and acknowledges that each unit or lump sum bid price includes the cost of all adjacent, incidental, related, and companion items which are shown on the drawings, called for in the specifications, or otherwise necessary to provide a complete and functional structure. The OWNER reserves the rights to increase, decrease, or delete from the Project quantities of work at the Unit Bid Price or Lump Sum Price in order to bring the total contract price to the budgeted project expenditures.

Project: Linda St

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 15' X 5'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			

Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			

Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			

Total No Bid

Project: Terra St

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 33' X 7'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			

Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			

Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			

Total No Bid

Project: W Olden St

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 640' X 30'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$17,800 ⁰⁰

Project: 10th St

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 152' X 31'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$11,600 ⁰⁰

Project: October Lane

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 1,210' X 31'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$74,000 ⁰⁰

Project: Meadowbrook Dr
Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 15' X 7'

Cost Breakdown Units Quantity Unit Price Subtotal

Prep Work In Place

Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			

Asphalt In Place

Tonage	Tons			
--------	------	--	--	--

Back Dressing

Restoration Area	SY			
------------------	----	--	--	--

Total \$ 3,800⁰⁰

Project: Allen St & E Olden St
Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 24' X 5'

Cost Breakdown Units Quantity Unit Price Subtotal

Prep Work In Place

Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			

Asphalt In Place

Tonage	Tons			
--------	------	--	--	--

Back Dressing

Restoration Area	SY			
------------------	----	--	--	--

Total \$ 3,500⁰⁰

Project: E 1st St
Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 84' X 23'

Cost Breakdown Units Quantity Unit Price Subtotal

Prep Work In Place

Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			

Asphalt In Place

Tonage	Tons			
--------	------	--	--	--

Back Dressing

Restoration Area	SY			
------------------	----	--	--	--

Total \$ 10,800⁰⁰

Project: Jackson St

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 51' X 10' / 40' X 18'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total			\$	10,500 ⁰⁰

Project: N Thayer Avenue

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 46' X 28'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total			\$	10,500 ⁰⁰

Project: Wastewater Treatment Plant

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 134' X 21' / 24' X 24'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total			\$	23,200 ⁰⁰

Project: Jackie Bridge

Description: Asphalt Repair / Road and Trail

Area: 52' X 72'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			

Total \$15,100⁰⁰

Project: Garfield Parking Lot

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 266' X 77'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			

Total \$28,900⁰⁰

Project: 6th St Bridge

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 63' X 30'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 8,100 ⁰⁰

Project: 5th St Bridge

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 41' X 19'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 8,700 ⁰⁰

Project: W Broadway Bridge

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 29' X 14'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 4,500 ⁰⁰

Project: Lincoln Ave Bridge
 Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 15' X 12'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 5,800 ⁰⁰

Project: Washington Avenue Bridge
 Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 17' X 5' / 26' X 16'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 7,400 ⁰⁰

Project: Skate Park
 Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 359' X 75'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 41,100 ⁰⁰

Project: Evans Trail

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 308' X 8' / 175' X 8' / 500' X 8'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 38,200 ⁰⁰

Project: Don Warden Park

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 512' X 50'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 39,600 ⁰⁰

Project: Municipal Golf Course

Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 14' X 6' / 6' X 6' / 9' X 6' / 6' X 7'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				\$ 6,800 ⁰⁰

Project: Saint Louis Bridge
Description: Asphalt Repair

Area: 30' X 19'

Cost Breakdown	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Subtotal
Prep Work In Place				
Excavation	CY			
Mill/Sawcut	LF			
Asphalt In Place				
Tonage	Tons			
Back Dressing				
Restoration Area	SY			
Total				<u>\$13,800⁰⁰</u>

Grand Total of all 23 Projects \$383,700⁰⁰