

BID TABULATION						
Item Description: Lighting for Civic Center Parking Lot						
Date: 6-18-2018						
Budget Amount:						

	Irby Utilities Neosho, MO	Flet. Reinhardt Bridgeton, MO	Border States Joplin, MO	Harry Cooper Spfd, MO	Graybar Jeff City, MO	Anixter St. Louis, MO
47 - Cooper Streetworks LED Lights	\$460.00	\$467.00	\$466.57	\$445.00	\$460.45	\$476.71
24 - Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$910.00	\$919.00	\$919.09	\$872.00	\$907.03	\$939.07
96 - Anchor Bolts	\$9.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.96	\$9.13	\$9.45
1 - Template	\$2.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.94	\$2.99	\$3.09
Total	\$44,341.40	\$44,005.00	\$43,986.95	\$42,706.10	\$44,289.34	\$45,853.34

BID TABULATION	
Item Description: Lighting for Civic Center Parking Lot	
Date: 6-18-2018	
Budget Amount:	

	Cape Elect W.P., MO					
47 - Cooper Streetworks LED Lights	\$572.34					
24 - Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$1,455.32					
96 - Anchor Bolts	No Bid					
1 - Template	No Bid					
Total	\$61,827.65					

City of West Plains
1910 Holiday Lane
West Plains, Missouri 65775
(417) 256-7176
Fax (417) 256-0255
Email purchasing@westplains.net

Vendor Quote

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price
44	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK Cooper Street Works 26 DAYS	\$460.00/EA	\$20,240.00
3	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK Cooper Street Works 26 DAYS	\$460.00/EA	\$1,380.00
5	SSS5M30SYM1XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles 33 DAYS	\$910.00/EA	\$4,550.00
15	SSS5M30SYM2XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles 33 DAYS	\$910.00/EA	\$13,650.00
4	SSS5M30SYM3XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles 33 DAYS	\$910.00/EA	\$3,640.00
96	AB1 33 DAYS	\$9.15/EA	\$878.40
1	TMP1 33 DAYS	\$2.85/EA	\$3.00

Need Quote By 6/12/2018

43,460.00

Company IRBY UTILITIES

Total \$44,341.40

Contact Vanessa Copeland

Jeff Shipley
Purchasing Agent

Phone 417-455-2160

City of West Plains
1910 Holiday Lane
West Plains, Missouri 65775
(417) 256-7176
Fax (417) 256-0255
Email purchasing@westplains.net

Vendor Quote

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price
44	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$467.00	\$20,548.00
3	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$467.00	\$1401.00
5	SSS5M30SYM1XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.00	\$4595.00
15	SSS5M30SYM2XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.00	\$13,785.00
4	SSS5M30SYM3XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.00	\$3676.00
	Lead times 4-6 weeks ARO		

Need Quote By 6/12/2018

Company Fletcher Reinhardt Company

Contact Kevin Arndt

Phone 314-506-0700

Total \$44,005.00

Jeff Shipley
Purchasing Agent

City of West Plains
1910 Holiday Lane
West Plains, Missouri 65775
(417) 256-7176
Fax (417) 256-0255
Email purchasing@westplains.net

Vendor Quote

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price
44	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$466.57	\$20,529.08
3	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$466.57	\$1,399.71
5	SSS5M30SYM1XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.09	\$4,595.45
15	SSS5M30SYM2XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.09	\$13,786.35
4	SSS5M30SYM3XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$919.09	\$3,676.36
	*29 Day lead on fixtures		
	*35 Day lead on poles		

Need Quote By 6/12/2018

Company Kriz Davis- a division of Border States

Total \$43,986.95

Contact Joel Armstrong

Jeff Shipley
Purchasing Agent

Phone 417-624-5650
jarmstrong@borderstates.com

City of West Plains
1910 Holiday Lane
West Plains, Missouri 65775
(417) 256-7176
Fax (417) 256-0255
Email purchasing@westplains.net

Vendor Quote

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price
44.	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	460.45	20,259.80
3	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	460.45	1,381.35
5	SSS5M30SYM1XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	907.03	4,535.15
15	SSS5M30SYM2XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	907.03	13,605.45
4	SSS5M30SYM3XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	907.03	3,628.12
96	ABI Anchor Bolts	9.13	876.48
1	TMP1 Anchor Bolt Template	2.99	2.99

Need Quote By 6/12/2018

Company Graybar Electric

Contact Jason Franken

Phone 573-681-6409

Total **\$44,289.34**

Jeff Shipley
Purchasing Agent

City of West Plains
1910 Holiday Lane
West Plains, Missouri 65775
(417) 256-7176
Fax (417) 256-0255
Email purchasing@westplains.net

Vendor Quote

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price
44.	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$476.71	\$20,975.24
3	USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK Cooper Street Works	\$476.71	\$1,430.13
5	SSS5M30SYM1XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$939.07	\$4,695.35
15	SSS5M30SYM2XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$939.07	\$14,086.05
4	SSS5M30SYM3XAEGH Cooper Square Steel Poles	\$939.07	\$3,756.28
96	AB1	\$9.45	\$907.20
1	7MPI	\$3.09	\$3.09
	Delivery: 4-6 weeks.		
	*Lead Times are approximately		
	26 days on fixtures +/- 3 days for		
	engineering and 33 days +/- 3 days		
	for engineering on the Poles.		

Need Quote By 6/12/2018

Company Anixter Inc.

Contact Elier Morales

Phone (913) 202-6952

Total **\$45,853.34**

Jeff Shipley
Purchasing Agent



T-B-N ELECTRIC SUPPLY
 1520 PORTER WAGONER BLVD
 WEST PLAINS, MO 65775-1832
 417-256-5175
 Fax 417-256-2543



Quotation

EXPIRATION DATE	QUOTE NUMBER
07/11/2018	S201521541
T-B-N ELECTRIC SUPPLY 1520 PORTER WAGONER BLVD WEST PLAINS, MO 65775-1832 417-256-5175 Fax 417-256-2543	
PAGE NO.	
1 of 1	

QUOTE TO:

SHIP TO:

CITY OF WEST PLAINS
 PO BOX 710
 WEST PLAINS, MO 65775

CITY OF WEST PLAINS
 1910 N HOLIDAY LANE
 WEST PLAINS, MO 65775-8000

CUSTOMER NUMBER	CUSTOMER PO NUMBER	JOB NAME / RELEASE NUMBER	SALESPERSON		
11570			STANLEY TAYLOR		
GIVEN BY		SHIP VIA	TERMS	DATE	FREIGHT EXEMPT
		BID	Net 30 Days	06/11/2018	No
ORDER QTY	ITEM NUMBER / DESCRIPTION		UNIT PRICE	EXT PRICE	
44ea	STREETWORK USSL-G-A02-D-U-T5-SA-BK *STANDARD ARM IS INCLUDED		572.340/ea	25182.96	
3ea	STREETWORK USSL-G-A02-D-U-T4-SA-BK *STANDARD ARM IS INCLUDED		572.340/ea	1717.02	
5ea	VALMONT DS330-500W300-D1-FP-AP-FBCS-AB/1/2" CPL/HH OPENING/FST		1455.319/ea	7276.60	
15ea	VALMONT DS330-500W300-D2-FP-AP-FBCS-AB/1/2" CPL/HH OPENING/FST		1455.319/ea	21829.79	
4ea	VALMONT DS330-500W300-D6-FP-AP-FBCS-AB/1/2" CPL/HH OPENING/FST		1455.319/ea	5821.28	

Thank you for your order! Your satisfaction is our number one goal!

Please visit our website at www.capeelectric.com
 Any questions call BRYCE GIRDLEY at or e-mail @
b.girdley@capeelectric.com

All Prices are subject to change without notice!

Taxes are not included
For terms and conditions see www.capeelectric.com

Subtotal	61827.65
S&H Charges	0.00
Amount Due	61827.65

